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We would like to introduce you to Noah Bundy, who is SODA’s 
Publication Director, sending out our monthly News, with assistance of 
Michele Appell.  He is a Core member of the SODA board. Noah was 
born on May 14, 1970 in Princeton, New Jersey, He was diagnosed at 
birth with Spina Bifida, and used a wheel chair for his mobility for may 
years. Noah has a sister Tamara, who is three years younger. When 
Noah was five years old the family moved to Seattle, WA where he 
attended several different schools, including Lowell, Meany middle 
school, a school on Lopez Island, where they lived for a couple of years, 
and then graduated from Interlake High School. When Noah was ten 
years old, his parents separated and his sister and mother moved to 
Minneapolis, Minnesota where his sister still lives. Noah’s father was 
Steve Bundy, who was the original creator and Director of SODA. 
Noah’s mother died several years ago, and his father died in 2020. He 
has lived in caregivers who care for him under the supervision of his 
Uncle Jim Bundy and his sister Tamara. 
Noah’s first home in Seattle was near the home where Monica lived, so 
they were childhood friends and spent time in each other’s homes. 
They both attended Camp Casey and Lowell School. Noah and his 
father moved to their current home in Bellevue in 2010. 
 
Noah has always been very social and outgoing with many friends. He 
has had several jobs, including being a greeter at Walgreen’s, and has 
been active in Bridge Ministry, Special Olympics (Track, Softball, 
Bowling.) 
 
He has always enjoyed “hanging out” at the Crossroads Mall, listening 
to music on Friday nights. He is an active member of the Highland 
Center and the Aktion Club. He enjoys watching Mariner’ games and 
many movies. 
 
We are glad that Noah is continuing to be an important member of 
SODA! 
 

 

 

SODA friends at 
Noah’s 51st 
Birthday Party 
May 2021 
 


